
Barbara Shurbet

From:
Sent;
To:
Cc:

Subject:

Barbara Shurbet < bshurbet@co.titus.tx.us >

Wednesday, )une 8, 202212:18 PM
'titusjud ge@g mail.com'
'James Webster'
Agenda ltem for June 13 - Extension of Bids for Jackson Oil & HE Spann

Attachments: Auditoas Scan_20220608_1 22401.pdf

Hello, Judge Lee: Please add an item to the June 13 agenda to extend the fuel and road materials bids from the above
vendors. The items in YELLOW on pages 1 are the items that are being extended. This
extension is without any price increase except for the fuel surcharge previously approved for HE Spann. page 2 ofthe
attachment is a summary of the other road materials bids that will expire on August 23, 2022.

None of the other vendors were willing to extend their bids at the current bid price. Those vendors unableto extend or
unresponsive to our request are: Martin Marletta, RK Hall, Richard Drake, and cleveland Asphalt.

Tha nk you I

---Original Message---
From: auditor@co.titus.tx.us <auditor@co.titus.tx.us>
Sent: Wednesday, )une 8,2022 72:24 pM

To: bshurbet@co.titus.tx. us

5ubject: Scanned image from Titus County -Auditor TH1062

Reply to: Auditor's Scan <auditor@co.titus.tx.us> Device Name: Titus County -Auditor TH1062 Device Model: MX-3051
Location: Not Set

File Format: PDF (Medium)

Resolution: 200dpi x 200dpi

Attached file is scanned image in PDF format.
Use Acrobat(R)Reade(R) or Adobe(R)Reader(R) ofAdobe systems tncorporated to view the document.
Adobe(R)Reade(R) can be downloaded from the following URL:
Adobe, the Adobe logo, Acrobat, the Adobe PDF logo, and Reader are registered trademarks or trademarks of Adobe
Systems lncorporated in the United States and other countries.

http://www.adobe.com/
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TITUS COUNTY, 2()2O BIDS, EFFECTIVE 7.1.20
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T|TUS COUNTy 2020 8t05, EFFECTTVE 7-1-20
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Barbara Shurbet

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Barbara Shurbet < bshurbet@co.titus.tx.us>
Wednesday, June 8, 2022 12:28 pM

'titusjudge@gmail.com'
'James Webster'
Agenda ltem for June 13 - Possible Extension of Bid from ERGON with price lncrease
Auditor's Scan_20220608 _1 23225.pdf

Hello, Brian: Ergon is willing to extend their bid for 60 days ONLY if the bid price is increased as indicated on the
attachment. Ergon is the only company that offered to extend their bid on the condition of a price increase.

Please add this to the June 13 agenda.

Thank you I

----Original Message---
From: a ud itor@co.titus.tx. us <a ud itor@co.titus.tx. us>
Sent: Wednesday, )une 8,2022 fZ32 pM

To : bshurbet@co.titus.tx.us
Subject: Scanned image from Titus County -Auditor TH1062

Reply to: Auditor's Scan <auditor@co.titus.tx.us> Device Name: Titus county -Auditor THIOG2 Device Model: Mx-3051
Location: Not Set

File Format: PDF MMR(G4)
Resolution: 200dpi x 200dpi

Attached file is scanned image in PDF format.
Use Acrobat(R)Reade(R) or Adobe(R)Reade(R) of Adobe Systems lncorporated to view the document.
Adobe(R)Reader(R) can be downloaded from the followtng URL:
Adobe, the Adobe logo, Acrobat, the Adobe PDF logo, and Reader are registered trademarks or trademarks of Adobe
Systems lncorporated in the United States and other countries.

http://www.adobe.com/
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Titus Auditor

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:

Subject:

per product.

Karen S. Sellers < Karen.Sellers@ergon.com>

Tuesday, June 7, 2022 8:33 AM
Titus Auditor
Tom O'Leary
RE: IEXTERNAL]EXIENDING BID FOR 60 DAYS-IITUS COUNW

Good morning Linda! We appreciate the offer to be able to extend our Titus County
contract an additiona-l 60 days through August ol2O22. Unfortunately, at this time, we are
unable to do so UNLESS rl"e County is willing to grant at least a $0.60 per gallon increase

P'ry'qp
Vrt t1

CSS-1
CSS-1H
CRS-2
CRS.2P

Current Price: Pro

$2.00
$2.00
$2.00
$z.zs

sed New Pri Delivered:

$2.60
s2.60
$z.oo
$2.85

[,et me know if this wilt work for you and, if not, Ergon will be happy to submit pricing on
any othcr bidding opportunities you might have.

Thank youl

Karen Sellers
ACCOUNT SPECIALIST
Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, lnc.

512-469-9292
512469-0391

ERGONEi.
ur'atrEo rY raBvrca. l,rr!,rEH rY loLutlorlt.

From: Titus Auditor <a uditor@co.titus.tx.us>
sent: Thursday, Ju ne 2,2022 z|51PM
To: Karen S. Sellers <Karen.Sellers@ergon.com>

SubjecE IEXTERNAL]EXTENDING BID FOR 60 DAYS-TITUS CoUNTY

Good aftefnoon Karen,

I have been asked to contact your entity to see if they would like to extend their bid. This would be for an additional

sixty days. The original contract allowed two years, for which we extended it in June of 2021' Would you consider

extending throu8h August 2021? I look forward to hearing from you.

1

Have a Breat rest of your day.

$2.78
$2.78
$2.78
$3.0s



U
Bid No. 2021-152, Annual Gontract for Emulsions

Section One: Less Than Transport Loads: FOB Origin - Provider Storage, Pick-Up Within Tarrant Coun ty:
{n*

-rtM,\,{

a
U

Notes: P2 Emulsions Plants LLC's response for Sections 2, 3, and 4 did not meet specifications as they failed to 
- I A *,'

bid all items within a section as required. Wright Asphalt Products Company submitted a "No Bid,'. l'tlA

3
Primary - Sections 1, 2,

Primary - Section 5

Ergon Asphalt &
Emulslons, lnc.

P2 Emulsion Plants,
LLC

Award Primary - Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, lnc.;
Sections 1,2,3,4.
Award Primary P2 Emulsions plants, LLC,; Section S

HUB - No COOP - Yes HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item Est. Qty Unit Price

Extended
Price Unit Price

Extended
Price

1 Emulsions - CRS-2/CRS-2H 27,000 GL $2.20 $s9,400.00 No Bid
Emulsions - CSS-1H 13,500 GL $2.25 No Bid No Bid

2a
Emulsions - CSS-1H, Diluted (70%
water, 30% Product 32,500 GL $0.89 $28,925.00 No Bid No Bid

2b
Emulsions - CSS-1H, Dituted (60%
water, 40% Product 1OO GL $r.08 $108.00 No Bid No Bid

Emulsions - CSS-1H, Diluted (20%
water, 80% Product

'15,000 GL $1.86 $27,900.00 No Bid No Bid

2d
Emulsions - CSS-1H, Diluted (30%
water, 70% Product 15,000 GL $1.67 $25,0s0.00 No Bid No Bid

3 Asphalt Emulsified Prime (AEP) 2,000 GL $2.70 $5,400.00 No Bid

Diluted, (70% water, 30% produ
Asphalt Emulsified Prime (AEP),

1OO GL $1.02 $102.00 No Bid No Bid

3b
Asphalt Emulsified Prime (AEP),
Diluted, water, 80% product 20,000 GL $2.22 $44,400.00 No Bid

3c
Diluted, 0% water, 70% product
Asphalt Emulsified Prime (AEP),

20,000 GL $1.98 $39,600.00 No Bid No Bid

4 Emulsions - CRS-1P $2.75 $275.00 No Bid No Bid

$2.55 $255.00 No Bid No Bid
5 Water, per Specifications on Page 16 20,000 GL $0.30 $6,000.00 No Bid

Total Bid Amount for Section One; $267,790.00 No Bid
Discount for items not listed: ,\ 0o/o No Bid

Minimum Pick-Up Amount: N/A No Bid
Added cost if below minimum: N/A No Bid

Location of plant: 600 Minton Road
Saginaw, TX 76179

No Bid

&,,r,*.
O{pt/t!,

4Yr,>o]5

I t'\f -

and 4

Description

No Bid

$30,375.00

No Bid

3a

No Bid

1OO GL
4a Emulsions - CRS'2P 1OO GL

No Bid



Primary - Sections 1, 2,
3, and 4 Primary - Section 5

Ergon Asphalt &
Emulsions, lnc.

P2 Emulslon Plants,
LLC

Award Primary - Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, lnc.;
Sections 1,2,3,4.
Award Primary P2 Emulsions Plants, LLC.; Section 5

HUB - No COOP - Yes HUB - No COOP - Yes
Extended

Price

8a-5p M-F; after hours

Unit Price

u uest

Extended
Price

Unit Price

No Bid

Est. Qty

Loading Hours:

Item Description

N/A No BidPump Charges:

N/A No BidDemurrage charge:

$2.20 $220.00 $274.00Emulsions - cRS-2/cRS-zH,|

$225.00 $2.44 $244.00Emulsions - CSS-1H

$89.00 No Bid1OO GL $0.89
Emulsions - CSS-1 H, Diluted (70%
water, 30% Product)

$108.00 No Bid No Bid1OO GL $'1.082b
Emulsions - CSS-1H, Diluted (60%
water, 40% Product)

No Bid$1.86 $27,900.00 No Bid15,000 GLEmulsions - CSS-1H, Dilutod (20%
water, 80% Product)

No Bid No Bid15,000 GL $1.67 $2s,050.00Emulsions - CSS-1 H, Diluted (30%
water, 70% Product)

$179.00$270.001OO GL $2.70Asphalt Emulsified Prime (AEP)

No Bid$102.00 No Bid1OO GL3a
Asphalt Emulsified Prime (AEP),

Diluted, (70% water, 30% product)

No Bid20,000 GL $2.22 $44,400.00Asphalt Emulsified Prims (AEP),
Diluted, (20% water, 80% product)

No Bid No Bid$1.98 $39,600.0020,000 GL3c
30% water, 7070 product)Diluted, (

Asphalt Emulsilied Prime (AEP),

No Bid No Bid$2.7 5' $275.00Emulsions - CRS-'l P
No Bid$2ss.00 No Bid1OO GL $2.55Emulsions - CRS-2P4a

No Bid No Bid$6,000.0020,000 GLWater, per Specilications on Page 16

$697.00Total Bid Amount for Section Two:

IBid No. 2021-152, Annual Gontract for Emulsions

Section One: Less Than Transport Loads: FOB Origin - Provider Storage, Pick-Up Within Tarrant County:

an ran S s n- e tuswo: rage, p

Tarrant Cou

Notes: p2 Emulsions Plants LLC's response for Sections 2, 3, and 4 did not meet specifications as they failed to

bid all items within a section as required. Wright Asphalt Products Company submitted a "No Bid".

lOO GL $2.74

2 1OO GL $2.25

2a No Bid

2d

$1.79

$1.02

3b No Bid

4 1OO GL

5 $0.30

$144,494.00



Primary - Sections 1, 2,
3, and 4

Ergon Asphalt &
Emulsions, lnc.

P2 Emulsion Plants,
LLC

Award Primary - Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, lnc.:
Sections 1,2,3,4.
Award Primary P2 Emulsions Plants, LLC.; Section s

HUB - No COOP - Yes HUB - No COOP - Yes

Item Description Est. Qty Unit Price
Extended

Price Unit Price
Extended

Price

Discount for items not listed: oo/o oo/"

Minimum Pick-Up Amount: N/A 5 Gallon
Added cost if below minimum: N/A N/A

Location of plant: 4648 Western Way
Temple, TX 76504

516 S Mclennan Loop,
Elm Mott, TX 76640

Loading Hours:
8a-5p M-F; after hours

upon request 6a-5p M-F

Pump Charges N/A $80.00 per load
D6munag6 Charge:

Emulsions - CRS-2/CRS-2H lr.IireIt1

N/A

$2.35 $235.00

$80.00/hr after 2 hours

$2.99 $299.00
2 Emulsions -CSS-1H 1OO GL $2.40 $240.00 $2.6e $269.00

Emulsions - CSS-1H, Diluted (70%
water, 30% product) 1OO GL $1.04 $104.00 No Bid No Bid

2b
Emulsions - CSS-'l H, Diluted (60%
water, 40% product) 1OO GL $'1.23 $123.O0 No Bid No Bid

Asphalt Emulsified Prime (AEP) $2.85 $285.00 $2.04 $204.00
Asphalt Emulsified Prime (AEP), Diluted
(70% water, 30% product) 1OO GL $1.'r7 $117.00 No Bid No Bid

3b
Asphalt Emulsified Prime (AEP), Diluted
(60% water, 40% product) 1OO GL $1.41 $'r4'r.00 No Bid

4 Emulsions - CRS-1P 1OO GL $2.94 $294"00 No Bid No Bid

Emulsions - CRS-2P i2.70,I OO GL s270.00
5 Water, per specifications on Page 16 '100 GL $0.30 $30.00 No Bid No Bid

Total Bid Amount for Section Throe $1,839.00
0%

IEq

Bid No. 2021-152, Annual Contract for Emulsions

Two: ess n Transport ongrn - er rage, Pic p thin 125 Mile tus
Tarrant Cou

Section Three: Tank Transport Loads Delivered: FOB Origin - Within Tarrant C_ounty

Notes: P2 Emulsions Plants LLC's response for Sections 2,3, and 4 did not meet specifications as they failed to
bid all items within a section as required. Wright Asphalt Products Company submitted a "No Bid".

tg
Primary - Section 5

l-

2a

3 1OO GL

No Bid

4a No Bid No Bld

$772.00
Discount for items not listed:



Bid No. 2021-152, Annual Contract for Emulsions

Sectio n Three: Tank Transport Loads Delivered: FOB Ongrn - Within Tarrant County

Section Four: Less Than Tank Transport Loads Delivered: FOB Origin - Within Tarrant County

Notes: P2 Emulsions Plants LLC's response for Sections 2, 3, and 4 did not meet specifications as they failed to
bid all items within a section as required. wright Asphalt products company submitted a ,'No Bid".

Primary - Sections 1, 2,
3, and 4 Primary - Section 5

Ergon Asphalt &
Emulsions, lnc.

P2 Emulsion Plants,
LLC

Award Primary - Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, lnc.;
Sections 1 ,2,3,4.
Award Primary P2 Emulsions plants, LLC.; Section 5

HUB - No cooP - cooP - Y
Item Description Est. Qty Extended

Price Unit Price Extended
Price

Minimum Pick-Up Amount: 5,500 Gallon 5,000 callon

N/A $0.25 per gallon

Location of plant
s tnaw TX 76.t79
600 Minton Road 516 S McLennan Loop,

Elm Mott, TX 76640

u n uest
8a-5p M-F; after hours

6a-5p M-F

Pump Charges: $90.00 per load $80.00 per load
Demurrage Charg€: $90.00/hr after 2 hourg $80.00/hr after 2 hours

1 Emulsions - CRS-z/CRS-2H ,IOO GL $2.35 $235.00 $2.99
2 Emulsions -CSS-1 H 1OO GL $2.40 $2.69 $269.00

water, 307o uct
Emulsions - CSS-1H, Diluted (70%

1OO GL $1.04 $104.00 No Bid

2b
watet, 40yo roduct
Emulsions - CSS-1H, Dituted (60%

1OO GL No Bid No Bid

J Asphalt Emulsified Prime (AEP ) 1OO GL $2.85 $2.04

3a
Diluted rodu70% water 30Yo

Asphalt Emulsified Prime (AEP),
1OO GL $1.17 No Bid

3b
Diluted 6QTo water, 4Q%o roduct
Asphalt Emulsified Prime (AEP),

1OO GL $1.41 $141.00 No Bid No Bid

4 Emulsions - CRS-1P 1OO GL $2.94 $294.00 No Bid
4a Emulsions - CRS-2P 1OO GL $2.70 No Bid

Water, Per Specifications on Page 16 1OO GL $0.30 No Bid No Bid
Total Bid Amount for Section Four $1,8s9.00 $772.0O

Discount for items not listed: o%

U

HUB - No

Unit Price

Added cost if below minimum:

Loading Hours:

$299.00
$240.00

No Bid

$1.23 $'r23.00

$285.00 $204.00

$117.00 No Bid

No Bid

$270.00 No Bid

$30.00

oy"



Bid No. 2021-152, Annual Contract for Emulsions

Section Four: Less Than Tank Transport Loads Delivered: FOB Origin - Within Tarrant Cou nty

Section Five: Producl: Less Than Tank Transport Loads : FOB Plant

Notes: P2 Emulsions Plants LLC's response for Sections 2, 3, and 4 did not meet specifications as they failed to
bid all items within a section as required. Wright Asphalt Products Company submitted a "No Bid".

Primary . Sections 1, 2,
3, and 4

Primary - Section 5

P2 Emulsion Plants,
LLC

Award Primary - Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, lnc.;
Sections 1 ,2,3,4.
Award Primary P2 Emulsions Plants, LLC.; Section 5

HUB - No COOP - Yes HUB - No COOP - Yes

Item Description Est" Qty

Minimum Pick-Up Amount:

Extended
Price

5,500 Gallons

Extended
Price

Added cost if below minimum N/A $0.25 per gallon

600 Minton Road
Saginaw, TX 76179

516 S McLennan Loop,
Elm Mott, TX 76640

Loading Hours: 8a-5p M-F; after hours
upon request 6a-5p M-F

Pump Charges: $80"00 per load

Demurrage Charge:

Itr[reL1 P2 Prime Luck 7.RTU

$90.00/hr after 2 hours

NETEftd

$80.00/hr after 2 hours

$1.20 $12o.oo
2 P2 Tack 41 RTU ,IOO GL No Bid No Bid $1.6s $165.00
3 P2 Prime 11 Concentrate 1OO GL No Bid No Bid $1.99 $199.00
4 P2 Stabilizer 1OO GL No Bid No Bid

P2 Rejuvenator 1OO GL No Bid No Bid $2.44 $244.00
1OO GL No Bid6 cwE-2 No Bid $2.74 $274.00

7 1OO GL No Bid No Bid $2.74 $274.00CWP (Cold Weather Patch)
ROC (Road Over Coat) 1OO GL No Bid No Bid $2.57 $2s7.00

$1,777.OO

5000 GallonMinimum Pick-Up Amount: N/A

$0.25/gallonN/A

N/A
516 S. McLennan Loop

EIm Mott, TX

I@E I@r

@
Ergon Asphalt &
Emulslons, lnc.

Unit Price Unit Price

5,000 Gallon

Location of plant:

$90.00 per load

No Bid

12.44 $244.00

Total Bid Amount for Section Five: No Bid

Discount for items not listed: N/A o%

Added cost if below minimum:

Location of plant:



Bid No. 2021-152, Annual Gontract for Emulsions

Section Five: Product: Less f han Tank Transport Loads : FOB plant

Notes: P2 Emulsions Plants LLC'S response for Sections 2, 3, and 4 did not meet specifications as they failed to '

bid all items within a section as required. wright Asphalt products company subitted a No Bid.

Primary - Sections 1,2,
and 4 Primary - Section 5

Ergon Asphalt &
Emulslons, lnc.

P2 Emulsion Ptants,
LLC

Award Primary - Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, lnc.;
Sections 1 ,2,3,4.
Award Primary P2 Emulsions plants, LLC.: Section 5

Item Description Est. Qty Unit Price Extended
Price Unit Price Extended

Price

Loading Hours: N/A 6a-5p M-F
Pump Charges: N/A $80.00

Demunage Charge: N/A .00 - first 2 hours
free

@ Er-t5EItr@ rftfrlEa

k

@


